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Reference No: F2018-0346 
 
Thank you for your request for information dated 05/04/2018 concerning ICT Usage 
 
This is to inform you that your request has been considered and I can provide the 
following response: 
 
The Request: 
 
For the financial year of 2017/18, please provide: 
a.        The amount of time spent by staff on social media websites on work ICT 
equipment. 
This information is not recorded. 
 
b.        The number of attempts that were made by staff to access pornographic sites 
on work ICT equipment. 
 
31858647 – Please note - Our Web blocking software will block any attempt to access 

parts of a web site which may fall into any of our blocked categories, example adverts. 
Additionally accessing just one website will generate multiple “hit” requests, as each part of 
that request will attempt to access different resources that make up the site. One Website 
request can generate over 100 hits. We are recording the total number of hits not the total 
number of individual website requests, we do not record that information. 
 
It is anticipated the 99% of the above attempts were unknown to the user and were 
background resources for the website they might have been on, again,  example adverts. 
Therefore the figures given do not represent a true figure of attempted access to sites that 
may be blocked. 

 
c.        The number of attempts made by staff to access blocked sites: pornographic 
and not pornographic; on work ICT equipment  
2064 
 
We believe that this request is now complete and shall be closed immediately. 
Should any further information be requested regarding this topic, a separate request 
will need to be submitted. 
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We would like to take this opportunity to thank you for your interest in Powys County 
Council. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
Information Compliance Team 
 
 
The supply of documents under Freedom of Information does not give the person or 
organisation who receives them an automatic right to re-use the documents in a way 
that would infringe copyright. 
 
You are free to use any information supplied for your own use, including for non-
commercial research purposes. The information may also be used for the purposes 
of news reporting. However, any other type of re-use, for example, by publishing the 
information or issuing copies to the public will require the permission of the copyright 
owner. 
 
The copyright of most of the information that we provide in response to Freedom of 
Information Act requests will be owned by Powys County Council. The copyright in 
other information may be owned by another person or organisation, as indicated in 
the information itself. 
 
For HMSO Guidance Notes on a range of copyright issues, see the Office of Public Sector Information(OPSI) 
website. 
http://www.opsi.gov.uk/advice/crown-copyright/copyright-guidance/index.htm 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the service you have received in relation to your 
request and wish to make a complaint, please contact Information Compliance. 
Our complaints procedure is available on request or on our website. 
 
If you are still not satisfied following this, you can make an appeal to the 
Information Commissioner, who is the statutory regulator. The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at: 
 
Information Commissioner's Office 
2nd floor 
Churchill House 
Churchill way 
Cardiff 
CF10 2HH 
Tel: 029 2067 8400  
Email: wales@ico.org.uk 
www.ico.org.uk 
 
 

 
 

https://emea01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.opsi.gov.uk%2Fadvice%2Fcrown-copyright%2Fcopyright-guidance%2Findex.htm&data=02%7C01%7CMostyn.Jones%40assembly.wales%7Cdaf51f1b596744e2611c08d5a9086a9a%7C38dc5129340c45148a044e8ef2771564%7C1%7C0%7C636600775982950364&sdata=CZg4E%2BSi4rmYJJfCPTE270AAbVMDr2KHy0wYoW3gi9Q%3D&reserved=0
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Mae'r e bost hwn ac unrhyw atodiad iddo yn gyfrinachol ac fe'i bwriedir ar gyfer y sawl a enwir arno yn unig. Gall gynnwys gwybodaeth 
freintiedig. Os yw wedi eich cyrraedd trwy gamgymeriad ni ellwch ei gopio, ei ddosbarthu na'i ddangos i unrhyw un arall a dylech 
gysylltu gyda Cyngor Sir Powys ar unwaith. Mae unrhyw gynnwys nad yw'n ymwneud gyda busnes swyddogol Cyngor Sir Powys yn 
bersonol i'r awdur ac nid yw'n awdurdodedig gan y Cyngor. 

This e mail and any attachments are confidential and intended for the named recipient only. The content may contain privileged 
information. If it has reached you by mistake, you should not copy, distribute or show the content to anyone but should contact Powys 
County Council at once. Any content that is not pertinent to Powys County Council business is personal to the author, and is not 
necessarily the view of the Council. 

 


